

Green = First Choice

Blue = Second Choice

LOT	LOT Description	Bidder	Cost	LOT	LOT Description	Bidder	Cost
LOT A1	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, 6 3/4 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 28.57	LOT A36	ANNOUNCEMENT ENVELOPES, A6 Open Side - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 48.60
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A2	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, 6 3/4 Regular Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 32.44	LOT A37	ANNOUNCEMENT ENVELOPES, A7 Open Side - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 50.14
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A3	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, 6 3/4 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 36.31	LOT A38	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 24# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 63.40
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A4	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, 6 3/4 Window Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 101.73	LOT A39	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 24# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 126.79
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A5	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, 6 3/4 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 32.44	LOT A40	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 54.55
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A6	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, 6 3/4 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 134.17	LOT A41	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 73.72
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A7	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #9 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 27.77	LOT A42	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 28# Brown Kraft - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 60.45
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A8	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #9 Regular Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 26.54	LOT A43	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Grip Peel / Peel-N-Seal	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 86.99
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A9	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #9 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 34.57	LOT A44	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 24# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 91.41
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A10	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #9 Window Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 32.44	LOT A45	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 24# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 154.81
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A11	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #9 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 32.44	LOT A46	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 98.78
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A12	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #9 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 39.81	LOT A47	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 119.42
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A13	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 28.42	LOT A48	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 28# Brown Kraft - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 103.21
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A14	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Regular Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 26.54	LOT A49	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Grip Peel / Peel-N-Seal	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 110.58
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A15	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 35.62	LOT A50	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 24# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 103.21
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A16	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Window Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 32.44	LOT A51	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 24# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 176.92
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A17	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 32.44	LOT A52	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 104.68
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A18	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 39.81	LOT A53	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 128.27
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A19	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Die-Cut Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 30.69	LOT A54	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 28# Brown Kraft - Catalog Open End - Center Seam	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 128.27
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A20	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #10 Die-Cut Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 35.76	LOT A55	CATALOG ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 28# White - Catalog Open End - Center Seam - with Grip Peel / Peel-N-Seal	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 125.32
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A21	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #11 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 40.61	LOT A56	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 24# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 50.13
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A22	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #11 Regular Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 94.36	LOT A57	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 24# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 113.53
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A23	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #11 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 60.52	LOT A58	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 42.50
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A24	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #11 Window Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 113.53	LOT A59	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 131.22
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A25	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #11 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 144.49	LOT A60	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 6" x 9" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Grip Peel / Peel-N-Seal	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 131.22
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A26	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #11 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 163.65	LOT A61	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 24# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 89.94
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A27	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #12 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 77.79	LOT A62	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 24# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 151.86
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A28	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #12 Regular Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 107.63	LOT A63	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 97.31
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A29	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #12 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 204.94	LOT A64	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 160.70
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID

Green = First Choice
Blue = Second Choice

LOT A30	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #12 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 224.10	LOT A65	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 9" x 12" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Grip Peel / Peel-N-Seal	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 160.70
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A31	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #14 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 90.83	LOT A66	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 24# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 100.26
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A32	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #14 Regular Side Seam - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 104.68	LOT A67	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 24# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 175.45
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A33	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #14 Regular Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 206.41	LOT A68	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 110.58
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A34	COMMERCIAL ENVELOPES, #14 Window Diagonal Seam - 24# White - Safety Tint	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 227.05	LOT A69	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Latex	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 173.97
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT A35	ANNOUNCEMENT ENVELOPES, A2 Open Side - 24# White	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 47.31	LOT A70	BOOKLET ENVELOPES, 10" x 13" - 28# White - Booklet Open Side - 2 Side Seams - with Grip Peel / Peel-N-Seal	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 173.97
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID

LOT	LOT Description	Bidder	Cost	LOT	LOT Description	Bidder	Cost
LOT B1	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 52.01	LOT B41	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 93.42
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B2	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 49.29	LOT B42	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 74.42
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B3	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 40.51	LOT B43	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 32.11
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B4	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 56.69	LOT B44	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 74.18
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B5	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 84.67	LOT B45	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 76.12
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B6	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 96.23	LOT B46	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 76.43
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B7	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 56.56	LOT B47	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 99.58
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B8	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 53.84	LOT B48	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 80.58
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B9	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 45.06	LOT B49	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 41.66
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B10	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 62.85	LOT B50	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 79.73
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B11	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 90.83	LOT B51	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 77.41
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B12	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 102.39	LOT B52	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 118.06
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B13	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 62.33	LOT B53	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 62.23
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B14	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 59.66	LOT B54	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 102.56
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B15	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 50.72	LOT B55	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 117.32
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B16	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 70.12	LOT B56	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 144.30
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B17	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 84.26	LOT B57	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 94.56
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B18	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 95.13	LOT B58	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 123.79
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B19	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 66.88	LOT B59	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 130.33
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B20	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 64.23	LOT B60	BOOKLET Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 170.94
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B21	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 55.25	LOT B61	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 115.13
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B22	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 76.29	LOT B62	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 141.07
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B23	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 90.43	LOT B63	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 170.21
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID

Green = First Choice

Blue = Second Choice

LOT B24	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Diagonal Seam, Window Envelope with Security Tint, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 101.30	LOT B64	BOOKLET Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 197.23
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B25	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 37.39	LOT B65	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 62.13
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B26	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 33.19	LOT B66	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 70.88
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B27	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 33.77	LOT B67	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 77.52
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B28	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 63.59	LOT B68	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 105.42
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B29	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 78.65	LOT B69	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 82.56
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B30	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 76.15	LOT B70	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 88.18
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B31	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 41.93	LOT B71	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 122.89
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B32	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 37.73	LOT B72	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 124.69
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B33	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 42.26	LOT B73	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 115.07
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B34	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 69.76	LOT B74	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 123.79
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B35	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #12	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 84.81	LOT B75	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 130.40
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B36	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Regular Envelope with Security Tint, #14	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 82.31	LOT B76	CATALOG Envelopes, 24# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 158.29
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B37	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope, 6 3/4	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 76.23	LOT B77	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6" x 9"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 135.46
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B38	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope, #9	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 69.63	LOT B78	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 6-1/2" x 9-1/2"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 141.07
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B39	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope, #10	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 71.58	LOT B79	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 9" x 12"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 175.79
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID
LOT B40	COMMERCIAL Envelopes, 24# VIRGIN White Wove, Side Seam, Window Envelope, #11	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 70.26	LOT B80	CATALOG Envelopes, 28# Virgin White Wove with LATEX, 10" x 13"	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 177.57
		Tension Corporation	NO BID			Tension Corporation	NO BID

LOT	LOT Description	Bidder	250,000 - 500,000		500,500 - 1,000,000		1,000,500 - 2,000,000		2,000,500 - and up			
			Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost		
			One Sided	Two Sided	One Sided	Two Sided	One Sided	Two Sided	One Sided	Two Sided		
LOT C1	ZY101 Enterprise Envelopes 2,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove #10 Double Window Safety Tinted; Black Ink; Printed 1 side Upper Window: 1"H x 3-3/4"L, placed 2-3/4" from bottom edge Lower Window: 1-3/8"H x 4-1/2"L, placed 5/8" from bottom edge Both Windows are 3/8" from left edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 156.44	
		Tension Corporation	\$ 20.45	\$ 20.45	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 161.80	
LOT C2	ZY101 Enterprise Envelopes Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 156.44	
		Tension Corporation	\$ 20.45	\$ 20.45	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	\$ 161.80	
LOT C3	ZY102 Enterprise Check Envelopes 2,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove #10 Double Window Safety Tinted; Black Ink; Printed 1 side Upper Window: 5/8"H x 2-1/4"L, placed 3-1/8" from bottom edge Lower Window: 1-1/16"H x 4-1/4"L, placed 13/16" from bottom edge Both Windows are 3/8" from left edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.42	\$ 17.42	\$ 140.28	
		Tension Corporation	\$ 20.60	\$ 20.60	\$ 19.40	\$ 19.40	\$ 18.80	\$ 18.80	\$ 18.70	\$ 18.70	\$ 155.00	
LOT C4	ZY102 Enterprise Check Envelopes Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.42	\$ 17.42	\$ 140.28	
		Tension Corporation	\$ 20.60	\$ 20.60	\$ 19.40	\$ 19.40	\$ 18.80	\$ 18.80	\$ 18.70	\$ 18.70	\$ 155.00	

Green = First Choice

Blue = Second Choice

LOT C5	ZY107 Enterprise Envelopes 2,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove #10 Double Window Safety Tinted; Black Ink; Printed 2 sided; "Return Service Requested" Upper Window: 1"H x 3-3/4"L, placed 2-3/4" from bottom edge Lower Window: 1-3/8"H x 4-1/2"L, placed 5/8" from bottom edge Both Windows are 3/8" from left edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.46	\$ 19.46	\$ 19.15	\$ 19.15	\$ 19.03	\$ 19.03	\$ 18.91	\$ 18.91	\$ 153.10
		Tension Corporation	\$ 21.10	\$ 21.10	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.20	\$ 19.20	
LOT C6	ZY107 Enterprise Envelopes Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.46	\$ 19.46	\$ 19.15	\$ 19.15	\$ 19.03	\$ 19.03	\$ 18.91	\$ 18.91	\$ 153.10
		Tension Corporation	\$ 21.10	\$ 21.10	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.20	\$ 19.20	
LOT C7	ZY110 Single Window Envelopes 2,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove #10 Single Window Safety Tinted; Black Ink; Printed 1 Side Style: DISS (OSSS); Flap Size: 1-5/16" Window: 1-3/8"H x 4-1/2"L, placed 3/8" from left edge 5/8" from bottom edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.42	\$ 17.42	\$ 140.28
		Tension Corporation	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.46	\$ 18.46	
LOT C8	ZY110 Single Window Envelopes Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.68	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.55	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.49	\$ 17.42	\$ 17.42	\$ 140.28
		Tension Corporation	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.46	\$ 18.46	
LOT C9	ZY115 Enterprise Envelopes 2,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove #10 Double Window Safety Tinted; Black Ink; Printed 2 Sided "Important - Open Right Away" Upper Window: 1"H x 3-3/4"L, placed 2-3/4" from bottom edge Lower Window: 1-3/8"H x 4-1/2"L, placed 5/8" from bottom edge Both Windows are 3/8" from left edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.47	\$ 18.47	\$ 18.24	\$ 18.24	\$ 18.09	\$ 18.09	\$ 146.82
		Tension Corporation	\$ 21.10	\$ 21.10	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.20	\$ 19.20	
LOT C10	ZY115 Enterprise Envelopes Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.47	\$ 18.47	\$ 18.24	\$ 18.24	\$ 18.09	\$ 18.09	\$ 146.82
		Tension Corporation	\$ 21.10	\$ 21.10	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.90	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.30	\$ 19.20	\$ 19.20	
LOT C11	ZY116 Enterprise Envelopes 1,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove Safety Tinted; 6" x 9-1/2" Booklet; Double Window; Black Ink; Printed 1 side Upper Window: 1"H x 3-3/4"L, placed 4-1/4" from bottom edge Lower Window: 1-3/8"H x 4-1/2"L, placed 2-1/4" from bottom edge Both Windows are 3/8" from left edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 25.62	\$ 25.62	\$ 24.84	\$ 24.84	\$ 24.39	\$ 24.39	\$ 24.12	\$ 24.12	\$ 197.94
		Tension Corporation	\$ 26.14	\$ 26.14	\$ 24.14	\$ 24.14	\$ 22.14	\$ 22.14	\$ 22.14	\$ 22.14	
LOT C12	ZY116 Enterprise Envelopes Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 25.62	\$ 25.62	\$ 24.84	\$ 24.84	\$ 24.39	\$ 24.39	\$ 24.12	\$ 24.12	\$ 197.94
		Tension Corporation	\$ 26.14	\$ 26.14	\$ 24.14	\$ 24.14	\$ 22.14	\$ 22.14	\$ 22.14	\$ 22.14	
LOT C13	BVS3672 Dept of Transportation Envelope 2,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove #10 Single Window; Black Ink; Printed 1 side Window: 1-1/8"H x 4-1/4"L, placed 5/8" from left and bottom edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 156.44
		Tension Corporation	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.46	\$ 18.46	
LOT C14	BVS3672 Dept of Transportation Envelope Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 156.44
		Tension Corporation	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.46	\$ 18.46	
LOT C15	BVS2305 Dept of Transportation Envelope 2,000 carton pack w/ center dividers; 24# White Wove #10 Single Window; Black Ink; Printed 1 side Window: 1-1/8"H x 4-1/4"L, placed 5/8" from left and bottom edge No printed indicia.	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 156.44
		Tension Corporation	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.46	\$ 18.46	
LOT C16	BVS2305 Dept of Transportation Envelope Same envelope as above; however, printed permit incia	Cenveo Worldwide Limited	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.66	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 19.52	\$ 156.44
		Tension Corporation	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.81	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.61	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.56	\$ 18.46	\$ 18.46	

